

**Aggregate 2021-002 Bid Tabulation**

Item	Description	Estimated Quantity (Tons)	Shelly Materials, Inc.		Osborne Concrete & Stone Co.		The Arms Trucking Co.		Hallmark Excavating		Ontario Stone Corp.	
			Unit Price/Ton	Total	Unit Price/Ton	Total	Unit Price/Ton	Total	Unit Price/Ton	Total	Unit Price/Ton	Total
1	#1 and 2 Lime Stone	270	\$28.00	\$7,560.00	\$29.00	\$7,830.00	\$27.30	\$7,371.00	\$27.18	\$7,338.60	\$26.50	\$7,155.00
2	#304 Lime Stone	5,000	\$22.05	\$110,250.00	\$22.75	\$113,750.00	\$21.65	\$108,250.00	\$21.30	\$106,500.00	\$21.00	\$105,000.00
3	#411 Lime Stone	2,725	\$23.70	\$64,582.50	\$23.50	\$64,037.50	\$22.25	\$60,631.25	\$21.70	\$59,132.50	\$21.75	\$59,268.75
4	#10 Lime Stone	325	\$23.30	\$7,572.50	\$23.65	\$7,686.25	\$21.90	\$7,117.50	\$22.05	\$7,166.25	\$21.75	\$7,068.75
5	#4 Lime Stone	125	\$28.00	\$3,500.00	\$29.75	\$3,718.75	\$27.60	\$3,450.00	\$27.30	\$3,412.50	\$26.50	\$3,312.50
6	#57 Lime Stone	100	\$28.65	\$2,865.00	\$29.00	\$2,900.00	\$27.30	\$2,730.00	\$27.12	\$2,712.00	\$26.00	\$2,600.00
7	#8 Lime Stone	25	\$29.75	\$743.75	\$30.75	\$768.75	\$28.25	\$706.25	\$28.85	\$721.25	\$26.00	\$650.00
8	#601 A Lime Stone	100	\$52.25	\$5,225.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$52.95	\$5,295.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$57.50	\$5,750.00
9	#601 B Lime Stone	50	\$51.80	\$2,590.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$49.00	\$2,450.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$54.00	\$2,700.00
10	#601 C Lime Stone	80	\$50.50	\$4,040.00	\$62.00	\$4,960.00	\$44.55	\$3,564.00	\$60.00	\$4,800.00	\$43.00	\$3,440.00
11	#601 D Lime Stone	25	\$49.10	\$1,227.50	\$59.00	\$1,475.00	\$38.25	\$956.25	\$52.00	\$1,300.00	\$38.00	\$950.00
12	#57 Washed Gravel	80	\$23.60	\$1,888.00	\$39.00	\$3,120.00	\$22.60	\$1,808.00	\$26.90	\$2,152.00	\$22.50	\$1,800.00
13	#3 Cobble	25	\$22.75	\$568.75	No Bid	\$0.00	\$28.75	\$718.75	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00
TOTAL		8,930		\$212,613.00		\$210,246.25 for bid items		\$205,048.00		\$195,235.10 for bid items		\$199,695.00 for bid items
	Bid Bond/Check			Bid Bond		Bid Bond		Bid Bond		Bid Bond		Bid Bond

\*\*\*Please note, the total's shown above are based on the invitation to bid's estimated quantity's to be purchased. The awarded purchase order will be for the budgeted amount of \$200,000\*\*\*